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Chester 80 x 50 Double Flat
Fine Fireclay Butler Sink

The Chester double bowl sink is the only one in
the Turner Hastings range with a tap landing and
tap hole option on the sink! This allows you to fit
the sink into narrower bench tops where there is
no room for the tap behind the sink. Made in
Europe, the high quality fireclay and glazing is
highly durable and thermal shock resistant,
meaning it can withstand fast changes in
temperatures such as boiling water on a cold
morning. The sink is highly stain and chemical
resistant, making it more hygienic than most
sinks on the market. Adding to the unique beauty
of this sink is its fine fireclay composition, which
is a stronger and less brittle product than
ceramic, making it highly durable against the
impacts of daily washing up. With a lifetime
warranty, you cannot go wrong with a Turner
Hastings sink. It includes two free basket wastes
to suit. Protect the base of your sink using either
the stainless steel grids custom made to suit the
Chester bowls, or use the rubber sink mat (both
options are purchased separately).

Dimensions: 793mm W x 491mm D x 195mm H

Capacity per bowl: 30L

Colour: White gloss

Tapholes: 0 or 1 taphole

Waste: Waste with overflow kit included for 1
taphole sink, 2 x 50mm basket wastes included
for 0 taphole sink

Features: Suitable for use with food waste
disposer – we recommend purchase of an
extended flange and a model with anti-vibration
collar
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